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Picks of the day

Myles Turner - Lower 7.5 Rebounds | Available on:

Jabari Smith Jr - Higher 13.5 Points | Available on:

Domantas Sabonis - Lower 28.5 Points+ Assists | Available on:

DeMar DeRozan - Higher 34.5 Points + Rebound + Assists | Available on:

GG Jackson - Lower 18.5 Points | Available on:



Myles Turner

DeMar DeRozen

Lower 7.5 Rebounds

Higher 34.5 Points+Revounds+Assists

Due to his recent form, Myles Turner will grab fewer than 7.5 rebounds 
against the Raptors. His form hasn’t been consistent and even without 
Jakob Poeltl in the lineup, the Raptors still emphasize team rebounding, 
which can limit Turner’s opportunities. Turner’s tendency to focus on shot-
blocking and rim protection over crashing the boards further reduced his 
chances of reaching that rebound mark.

Domantas Sabonis
Lower 28.5 Points + Assists

DeMar DeRozan will surpass the 34.5 mark against the Knicks due to 
favorable matchups and his recent strong form. The Knicks’ perimeter 
defense, particularly with players like Josh Hart, can struggle against
elite mid-range scorers like DeRozan, allowing him to capitalize in his 
comfort zones. DeRozan’s recent performances have shown a well-
rounded contribution in scoring, playmaking, and rebounding, making it
likely he will exceed the combined total against New York’s defense.

BMA Ladder Order

Sabonis will fall short of 28.5 points and assists against OKC due to their 
solid defensive schemes and the presence of defensive anchor Chet 
Holmgren, who can disrupt Sabonis in the paint. OKC’s ability to switch
effectively on defense limits Sabonis’ opportunities to exploit mismatches 
and could reduce his scoring and playmaking. Additionally, Sabonis’ recent 
form may have leaned more toward facilitating rather than aggressive 
scoring, making it difficult for him to hit the combined mark.



GG Jackson

Jabari Smith Jr

Lower 18.5 Points

Higher 13.5 Points

GG Jackson will score fewer than 18.5 points against the Spurs due to 
his limited offensive role and inconsistent output in recent games. The 
Spurs’ defense, led by Wembanyama, can effectively challenge shots in 
the paint and disrupt offensive flow, making it hard for Jackson to find 
buckets. Additionally, as a young player still developing in the league, 
Jackson will struggle to consistently reach that point total against a 
disciplined defensive team like the Spurs.

Smith Jr will score more than 13.5 points against the Orlando Magic 
given his recent scoring surge and growing role in the Rockets’ offense. 
Orlando’s defense, while solid, has gaps on the perimeter that Smith 
could exploit with his shooting range and ability to stretch the floor. 
Additionally, his matchup against Orlando’s forwards, who can be 
inconsistent defensively, provided him with a favorable opportunity to
exceed the points projection.



BMA Ladder Combination

2 Leg Parlay (Underdog)

2 Leg Parlay (Underdog)

3 Leg Parlay (Underdog)



BMA Ladder Combination

4 Leg Parlay (Underdog)

5 Leg Parlay (Underdog)


